Stock Number	Estimated Number of Units (2017)	Unit	Description	Approved Brand (Manufacturer's Product Code)	Bidder	Bidder Terms	Bidder Brand	Bidder Manufacturer's Product Code	Pack Size	Estimated Servings per Case	Cost per Case	Required Number of Cases	Cost per Serving	Extended Total Cost	COMMENTS	LEAD TIME FROM ORDER (IN WEEKS)
Column 1	Column 2	Column 3	Column 4	Column 5	Column 6	Column 7	Column 8	Column 9	Column 10	Column 11	Column 12	Column 13	Column 14	Column 15	Column 16	Column 17
			Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.	PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT CURRENT AWARDS. ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED.	ITEMS MARKED WITH AN ASTERICK (**) INDICATES AVAILABLE USDA COMMODITIES MIGHT IMPACT USAGE.	ALL SHIP LOTS ARE IN CASES.	Items listed are Pre- Approved Brands, SCBE will accept an approved equal (1) as long as it meets the bid specification and (2) tested and approved through SCBE's Sample Submission Process.									
1023	23,500	SERVINGS		Bake Crafters 2164 Sky Blue WMBLU248 Smart Choice 06661 Otis Spunkmeyer 10143 Alpha Baking 75712 Bake Crafters 1211 Smart Choice 07661 Bake Crafters 1314 Otis Spunkmeyer 10147	Sky Blue Foods	Net 15	Sky Blue Foods	WMBLU248	48	48	13.2	490	\$0.2750	\$6,462.50		10 business days to shipment
1023	23,500	SERVINGS	each muffin must provide 2 grain/bread serving for Child	Bake Crafters 2164 Sky Blue WMBLU248 Smart Choice 06661 Otis Spunkmeyer 10143 Alpha Baking 75712 Bake Crafters 1211 Smart Choice 07661 Bake Crafters 1314 Otis Spunkmeyer 10147	National Food Group	Net 30 days	NFG	612086	48/3.1 oz.	48	14.64	490	\$0.3050	\$7,167.50	with White WG	3
1023	23,500	SERVINGS	each muffin must provide 2 grain/bread serving for Child	Bake Crafters 2164 Sky Blue WMBLU248 Smart Choice 06661 Otis Spunkmeyer 10143 Alpha Baking 75712 Bake Crafters 1211 Smart Choice 07661 Bake Crafters 1314 Otis Spunkmeyer 10147	Bake Crafters Food Company	Net 14 Days	Bake Crafters Food Company	2164	48/3.1oz	48	15.69	490	\$0.3269	\$7,681.56	ior 4 pallet minimu	1 2 Weeks
1023	23,500	SERVINGS	Muffins, WG Blueberry RF Fortified - Individually wrapped, each muffin must provide 2 grain/bread serving for Child Nutrition Programs. Grain credibility statement required. CN labeled. Approximate pack: 48-3.6 oz servings per case. Ship Lot: 225 cases	Bake Crafters 2164 Sky Blue WMBLU248 Smart Choice 06661 Otis Spunkmeyer 10143 Alpha Baking 75712 Bake Crafters 1211 Smart Choice 07661 Bake Crafters 1314 Otis Spunkmeyer 10147	J.S.B. Industries, Inc. dba/ Muffin Town	225 cases min	Smart Choice	06661	48ct./3.6oz. IW	48	16.95	490	\$0.3531	\$8,298.44		14 days
1023	23,500	SERVINGS	each muffin must provide 2 grain/bread serving for Child	Bake Crafters 2164 Sky Blue WMBLU248 Smart Choice 06661 Otis Spunkmeyer 10143 Alpha Baking 75712 Bake Crafters 1211 Smart Choice 07661 Bake Crafters 1314 Otis Spunkmeyer 10147	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14 days	Otis Spunkmeyer/Aryzta	10147	48/4.0oz	48	27.91	490	\$0.5815	\$13,664.27		14 days

Stock Number	Estimated Number of Units (2017)	Unit	Description	Approved Brand (Manufacturer's Product Code)	Bidder	Bidder Terms	Bidder Brand	Bidder Manufacturer's Product Code	Pack Size	Estimated Servings per Case	Cost per Case	Required Number of Cases	Cost per Serving	Extended Total Cost	COMMENTS	LEAD TIME FROM ORDER (IN WEEKS)
Column 1	Column 2	Column 3	Column 4	Column 5	Column 6	Column 7	Column 8	Column 9	Column 10	Column 11	Column 12	Column 13	Column 14	Column 15	Column 16	Column 17
1064	64,000	SERVINGS	Oven Roasted Chicken Breast, 90%-95% Lean, (3 Slices per ounce), vacuum packed, 48# case to contain 4 seperate boxes, each box to contain 4/3# bags. Each serving (by weight) provides 1.5 oz. equivalent meat for Child Nutriton Meal Pattern Requirements.  Ship Lot: 500 cases	Carl Buddig 53110	Carl Buddig	Net 30		#53110	8/1.5lb Bags - 12lb case	96	\$29.04	667	0.3025	\$19,360.00	\$42.00	2 weeks
1070	24,000	SERVINGS	Asian Take Out Box Meal – IW, heat and serve. Container to include Asian seasoned chicken, whole grain rice, vegetables, and fruit. A serving must meet a 2 oz meat/meat alternate, 1 oz grain equivalent, ½ cup vegetable, and ½ cup fruit per Child Nutrition Program standards. CN label or crediting statement required.  Ship Lot: 500 cases	No Approved Brands	Tasty Brands	1%10, Net 11	Tasty Brands	15008	48/11.24 oz.	48	93.6	500	1.9500	\$46,800.00		14 Calendar Days
1148	75,000	SERVINGS	Fruit Juice Bars - Grape. Frozen product to contain a minimum of 20z of single strength Juice to meet 1/4 cup fruit/vegetable requirement for the Child Nutrition Programs. Must be CN labeled. Must have perforated tear tab, easy to open. Approximate Pack: 100-2.25 oz servings per case.  Ship Lot: 350 cases	Mr. J's 9054	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1149	75,000	SERVINGS	Fruit Juice Bars - Blue Raspberry. Frozen product to contain a minimum of 202 of Single strength juice to meet 1/4 cup fruit/vegetable requirement for the Child Nutrition Programs. Must be CN labeled. Must have perforated tear tab, easy to open. Approximate Pack: 100-2.25oz servings per case.  Ship Lot: 350 cases	Mr. J's 9060	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1191	30,000	SERVINGS	Apple Juice, Concentrate - 100% juice from concentrate. Must meet a minimum of 3/4 cup fruit for the Child Nutrition Programs. Approximate Pack: 70 - 6.0 oz servings per case. Ship Lot: 200 cases	Country Pure/Ardmore 42212 M & B Products, Inc. 2850 Suncup 50301	Country Pure Foods	Net 30 Days	Ardmore Farms	42212	70/6 OZ.	70	\$10.38	429	0.1483	\$4,448.57		2
1191	30,000	SERVINGS	Apple Juice, Concentrate - 100% juice from concentrate.  Must meet a minimum of 3/4 cup fruit for the Child Nutrition Programs. Approximate Pack: 70 - 6.0 oz servings per case.  Ship Lot: 200 cases	Country Pure/Ardmore 42212 M & B Products, Inc. 2850 Suncup 50301	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14 days	Ardmore	42212	70/6oz	70	\$11.54	429	0.1649	\$4,945.71		14 days
1195	30,000	SERVINGS	Fruit Punch Juice, Concentrate - 100% juice from concentrate. Must meet a minimum of 3/4 cup fruit for the Child Nutrition Programs. Approximate Pack: 70 - 6.0 oz servings per case.  Ship Lot: 200 cases	M & B Products, Inc. 2350 Country Pure 62042	Country Pure Foods	Net 30 Days	Ardmore Farms	42215	70/6 OZ.	70	\$10.82	429	0.1546	\$4,637.14		
1195	30,000	SERVINGS	Fruit Punch Juice, Concentrate - 100% juice from concentrate. Must meet a minimum of 3/4 cup fruit for the Child Nutrition Programs. Approximate Pack: 70 - 6.0 oz servings per case.  Ship Lot: 200 cases	M & B Products, Inc. 2350 Country Pure 62042	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14 days	Ardmore	42215	70/6oz	70	\$12.02	429	0.1717	\$5,151.43	42215-correct#	14 days
1197	30,000	SERVINGS	Grape Juice, Concentrate - 100% juice from concentrate. Must meet a minimum of 3/4 cup fruit for the Child Nutrition Programs. Approximate Pack: 70 - 6.0 oz servings per case. Ship Lot: 200 cases	Country Pure/Ardmore Farms 42213 M & B Product Inc. 2650 Suncup 50501 Vita Fresh 02504	Country Pure Foods	Net 30 Days	Ardmore Farms	42213	70/6 OZ.	70	\$13.61	429	0.1944	\$5,832.86		
1197	30,000	SERVINGS	Grape Juice, Concentrate - 100% juice from concentrate.  Must meet a minimum of 3/4 cup fruit for the Child Nutrition Programs. Approximate Pack: 70 - 6.0 oz servings per case.  Ship Lot: 200 cases	Country Pure/Ardmore Farms 42213 M & B Product Inc. 2650 Suncup 50501 Vita Fresh 02504	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14 days	Ardmore	42213	70/6oz	70	\$15.10	429	0.2157	\$6,471.86		14 days

Stock Number	Estimated Number of Units (2017)	Unit	Description	Approved Brand (Manufacturer's Product Code)	Bidder	Bidder Terms	Bidder Brand	Bidder Manufacturer's Product Code	Pack Size	Estimated Servings per Case	Cost per Case	Required Number of Cases	Cost per Serving	Extended Total Cost	COMMENTS	LEAD TIME FROM ORDER (IN WEEKS)
Column 1	Column 2	Column 3	Column 4	Column 5	Column 6	Column 7	Column 8	Column 9	Column 10	Column 11	Column 12	Column 13	Column 14	Column 15	Column 16	Column 17
1198	30,000	SERVINGS	Orange Juice, Concentrate - 100% juice from concentrate. Must meet a minimum of 3/4 cup fruit for the Child Nutrition Programs. Approximate Pack: 70 - 6.0 oz servings per case. Ship Lot: 200 cases		Country Pure Foods	Net 30 Days	Ardmore Farms	42210	70/6 OZ.	70	\$13.78	429	0.1969	\$5,905.71		
1198	30,000	SERVINGS	Orange Juice, Concentrate - 100% juice from concentrate. Must meet a minimum of 3/4 cup fruit for the Child Nutrition Programs. Approximate Pack: 70 - 6.0 oz servings per case. Ship Lot: 200 cases		Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14 days	Ardmore	42210	70/6oz	70	\$15.32	429	0.2189	\$6,565.71		14 days
1284	30,000	SERVINGS	Sandwich, Soy/Nutless Butter and Grape Jelly Frozen, individually wrapped. 1 serving to meet a minimum of 2 oz of grain and 2 oz meat/meat alternate equivalents per Child Nutrition Programs Standards. Approximate Pack: 40-72-4.6 oz./case.  Ship Lot: 300 cases	Albie's 608	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14 days	Albies	608	40/4.6oz	40	\$33.20	750	0.8300	\$24,900.00		14 days
1284	30,000	SERVINGS	Sandwich, Soy/Nutless Butter and Grape Jelly Frozen, individually wrapped. 1 serving to meet a minimum of 2 oz of grain and 2 oz meat/meat alternate equivalents per Child Nutrition Programs Standards. Approximate Pack: 40-72-4.6 oz./case.  Ship Lot: 300 cases	Albie's 608	National Food Group	Net 30 days	Albies	608	40/4.6oz	40	\$34.00	750	0.8500	\$25,500.00		3
1284	30,000	SERVINGS	Sandwich, Soy/Nutless Butter and Grape Jelly Frozen, individually wrapped. 1 serving to meet a minimum of 2 oz of grain and 2 oz meat/meat alternate equivalents per Child Nutrition Programs Standards. Approximate Pack: 40-72-4.6 oz./case. Ship Lot: 300 cases	Albie's 608	J.S.B. Industries, Inc. dba/ Muffin Town	300 cs minimum	SunWise	15228	48ct./5.2oz.	48	\$43.88	625	0.9142	\$27,425.00	available as a com	14 days
1300	24,000	SERVINGS	Spaghetti w/Meat Sauce Kit -Heat and serve individual meal kit containing spaghetti noodles and meat sauce. Each individual meal kit must provide a minimum of 2 oz eq meat/meat alternate, 1 oz eq of grain, and ½ cup eq of red/orange vegetables per USDA child nutrition program standards. Crediting statement or CN label required. All three components to be contained in one single, sealed, ovenable tray.  Ship Lot: 250 cases	ES Foods 61851	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1400	64,000	SERVINGS	Turkey Bologna, Frozen. Presliced. 1/2 oz.slices. The bologna must be manufactured from turkey with spices Finished product to be IOF and wrapped securely to prevent freezer burn. CN statement must be submitted with bid indicating portion size that is equal to 1 oz. meat/meat alternate for Child Nutrition Programs. Serving Size = 1 oz. Approximate Pack 15 lbs per case.  Ship Lot: 250 cases	Butterball 85504	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14 days	Butterball		12/2#	384	\$29.13	167	0.0759	\$4,855.00		14 days
1582	27,000	SERVINGS	Croissants, Whole Grain, Round, Sliced - Frozen. Made with whole wheat flour. Weight of 2.2 oz. or greater per croissant as stated on product nutrition label. Entire croissant must meet a minimum of 2 oz Grain Equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program. Approximate Pack: 150 servings per case. Ship Lot: 150 cases		Hadley Farms, Inc.	Net 14 Days	Hadley Farms, Inc.	139	144/2.2 oz.	144	32.4	188	0.2250	\$6,075.00		

Stock Number	Estimated Number of Units (2017)	Unit	Description	Approved Brand (Manufacturer's Product Code)	Bidder	Bidder Terms	Bidder Brand	Bidder Manufacturer's Product Code	Pack Size	Estimated Servings per Case	Cost per Case	Required Number of Cases	Cost per Serving	Extended Total Cost	COMMENTS	LEAD TIME FROM ORDER (IN WEEKS)
Column 1	Column 2	Column 3	Column 4	Column 5	Column 6	Column 7	Column 8	Column 9	Column 10	Column 11	Column 12	Column 13	Column 14	Column 15	Column 16	Column 17
1582	27,000	SERVINGS	Croissants, Whole Grain, Round, Sliced - Frozen. Made with whole wheat flour. Weight of 2.2 oz. or greater per croissant as stated on product nutrifion label. Entire croissant must meet a minimum of 2 oz Grain Equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program. Approximate Pack: 150 servings per case. Ship Lot: 150 cases		Bake Crafters Food Company	Net 14 Days	Bake Crafters Food Company	3286	80/2.2oz	80	19.53	338	0.2441	\$6,591.38	or 4 pallet minimu	ı 2 Weeks
1590	85,000	SERVINGS	Fruit Juice Bars - Fruit Punch. Frozen product to contain a minimum of 2oz of single strength juice to meet 1/4 cup fruit/vegetable requirement for the Child Nutrition Programs. Must be CN labeled. Must have perforated tear tab, easy to open. Approximate Pack: 100-2.25 oz servings per case.  Ship Lot: 425 cases	Mr. J's 9052	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1592	24,000	SERVINGS	Fruit Loaf, Banana, WG - Precooked made with bananas and no tropical oils or trans fats. Individually wrapped. Each loaf be 50% whole grain and provide 2 grain servings for the National School Breakfast Program. Grain credibility statement required. Pack size 96 per case.  Ship Lot: 250 cases		Sky Blue Foods	Net 15	Sky Blue Foods	BBLA372	72	72	21.6	333	0.3000	\$7,200.00		10 business days to shipment
1592	24,000	SERVINGS	Fruit Loaf, Banana, WG - Precooked made with bananas and no tropical oils or trans fats. Individually wrapped. Each loaf be 50% whole grain and provide 2 grain servings for the National School Breakfast Program. Grain credibility statement required. Pack size 96 per case.  Ship Lot: 250 cases		National Food Group	Net 30 Days	NFG	612085	48/3.1 oz.	48	14.64	500	0.3050	\$7,320.00	with White WG	3
1592	24,000	SERVINGS	Fruit Loaf, Banana, WG - Precooked made with bananas and no tropical oils or trans fats. Individually wrapped. Each loaf be 50% whole grain and provide 2 grain servings for the National School Breakfast Program. Grain credibility statement required. Pack size 96 per case.  Ship Lot: 250 cases		J.S.B. Industries, Inc. dba/ Muffin Town	300 cases minimum	Smart Choice	52675	48ct/3.6oz. IW	48	15.48	500	0.3225	\$7,740.00		14 days
1674A	24,000	SERVINGS	Bun, Breakfast - Frozen. Individually wrapped. Thaw and serve fortified bun. Entire bun must meet a minimum of 2.0 oz Grain Equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program. Approximately packed: 80-2.5 oz servings per case.  Ship Lot: 300 cases	Sky Blue Bakery WWB5160 Super Bakery 6060 Bake Crafter's 2003	Super Bakery	Net 11	Goodyman	6060	2.75 oz.	80	\$18.56	300	0.2320	\$5,568.00	0 cs min order mix	10 working days
1674A	24,000	SERVINGS	Bun, Breakfast - Frozen. Individually wrapped. Thaw and serve fortified bun. Entire bun must meet a minimum of 2.0 oz Grain Equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program. Approximately packed: 80-2.5 oz servings per case.  Ship Lot: 300 cases	Sky Blue Bakery WWB5160 Super Bakery 6060 Bake Crafter's 2003	Sky Blue Foods	Net 15	Sky Blue Foods	WWB5160	60	60	\$14.10	400	0.2350	\$5,640.00		10 business days to shipment
1674A	24,000	SERVINGS	Bun, Breakfast - Frozen. Individually wrapped. Thaw and serve fortified bun. Entire bun must meet a minimum of 2.0 oz Grain Equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program. Approximately packed: 80-2.5 oz servings per case.  Ship Lot: 300 cases	Sky Blue Bakery WWB5160 Super Bakery 6060 Bake Crafter's 2003	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14 days	Super Bakery	6060	80/2.75oz	80	18.95	300	0.2369	\$5,685.00		14days

Stock Number	Estimated Number of Units (2017)	Unit	Description	Approved Brand (Manufacturer's Product Code)	Bidder	Bidder Terms	Bidder Brand	Bidder Manufacturer's Product Code	Pack Size	Estimated Servings per Case	Cost per Case	Required Number of Cases	Cost per Serving	Extended Total Cost	COMMENTS	LEAD TIME FROM ORDER (IN WEEKS)
Column 1	Column 2	Column 3	Column 4	Column 5	Column 6	Column 7	Column 8	Column 9	Column 10	Column 11	Column 12	Column 13	Column 14	Column 15	Column 16	Column 17
1674A	24,000	SERVINGS	Bun, Breakfast - Frozen. Individually wrapped. Thaw and serve fortified bun. Entire bun must meet a minimum of 2.0 oz Grain Equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program. Approximately packed: 80-2.5 oz servings per case.  Ship Lot: 300 cases	Sky Blue Bakery WWB5160 Super Bakery 6060 Bake Crafter's 2003	Bake Crafters Food Company	Net 14 Days	Bake Crafters Food Company	2003	60/3oz	60	\$19.78	400	0.3297	\$7,912.00	ior 4 pallet minimu	1 2 Weeks
1688	54,000	SERVINGS	Grab and Go, Deli Meal, Turkey Pepperoni Pizza. Prepackaged individual servings containing a minimum of 2.0 meat/meat alternates and 2.0 oz. Grain per Child Nutrition Program guidelines. Grain component must be whole grain rich. Approximate pack: 48-3.93 oz. servings per case. Ship Lot: 500 cases	Tasty Brands 10102	Tasty Brands	1%10, Net 11	Tasty Brands	10102	48/5.58 oz.	48	\$67.07	1,125	1.3973	\$75,453.75	Bid Allowance of \$0.73 can be deducted from the case price in column L	14 Calendar Days
1689	88,000	SERVINGS	Grab and Go, Deli Meal, Turkey. Entire serving must meet a minimum of 2.0 meat/meat alternative and 2.0 oz Grain Equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program. Approximate pack: 48-3.93 oz servings per case.  Ship Lot: 900 cases	Tasty Brands 10202 Butterball Combo 103686	Tasty Brands	1%10, Net 11	Tasty Brands	10202	48/4.21 oz.	48	\$68.06	1,833	1.4179	\$124,776.67	Bid Allowance of \$1.00 can be deducted from the case price in column L	14 Calendar Days
1800	24,000	SERVINGS	Donut, Whole grain Breakfast – At least 51% Whole grain, fortified breakfast donut. Frozen, individually wrapped. Must meet 2 oz. grain equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program.  Ship Lot: 300 cases	Sky Blue Bakery FWD290 Super Bakery 19000 Bake Crafters 1915 Bake Crafters 1879	Super Bakery	Net 11	Super Bakery	19000	3.0 oz.	80	\$17.60	300	0.2200	\$5,280.00	0 cs min order mix	10 working days
1800	24,000	SERVINGS	Donut, Whole grain Breakfast – At least 51% Whole grain, fortified breakfast donut. Frozen, individually wrapped. Must meet 2 oz. grain equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program.  Ship Lot: 300 cases	Sky Blue Bakery FWD290 Super Bakery 19000 Bake Crafters 1915 Bake Crafters 1879	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14 days	Super Bakery	19000	80/3.0oz	80	17.92	300	0.2240	\$5,376.00		14 days
1800	24,000	SERVINGS	Donut, Whole grain Breakfast – At least 51% Whole grain, fortified breakfast donut. Frozen, individually wrapped. Must meet 2 oz. grain equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program.  Ship Lot: 300 cases	Sky Blue Bakery FWD290 Super Bakery 19000 Bake Crafters 1915 Bake Crafters 1879	Sky Blue Foods	Net 15	Sky Blue Foods	FWD290	90	90	\$21.15	267	0.2350	\$5,640.00		10 business days to shipment
1800	24,000	SERVINGS	Donut, Whole grain Breakfast – At least 51% Whole grain, fortified breakfast donut. Frozen, individually wrapped. Must meet 2 oz. grain equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program.  Ship Lot: 300 cases	Sky Blue Bakery FWD290 Super Bakery 19000 Bake Crafters 1915 Bake Crafters 1879	Bake Crafters Food Company	Net 14 Days	Bake Crafters Food Company	1879	60/3.2oz	60	\$20.11	400	0.3352	\$8,044.00	or 4 pallet minimu	2 Weeks
1818	24,000	SERVINGS	100 % Meat Franks - Frozen, Fully cooked, smoked, made of 100% meat. Made from turkey and/or Beef ingredients, exclude pork. Must provide 2oz meat/meat alternate per serving per Child Nutrition Program Standards. No cereal or dry milk added. Approximate Pack: 80/10# case  Ship Lot: 150 cases	No Approved Brands - SPEC Change	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14 days	Sara Lee/Briar Street	16751	2/5#	100.00	\$11.15	240	0.1115	\$2,676.00		14 days
1818	24,000	SERVINGS	100 % Meat Franks - Frozen, Fully cooked, smoked, made of 100% meat. Made from turkey and/or Beef ingredients, exclude pork. Must provide 2oz meat/meat alternate per serving per Child Nutrition Program Standards. No cereal or dry milk added. Approximate Pack: 80/10# case Ship Lot: 150 cases	No Approved Brands - SPEC Change	Cargill Meat Solutions	NET 30	Shady Brook Farms	700196	4/5 lbs.	160.00	\$41.42	150	0.2589	\$6,213.00	Our turkey is CRAU. No hormones or antibiotics used to promote growth.	3 weeks

Stock Number	Estimated Number of Units (2017)	Unit	Description	Approved Brand (Manufacturer's Product Code)	Bidder	Bidder Terms	Bidder Brand	Bidder Manufacturer's Product Code	Pack Size	Estimated Servings per Case	Cost per Case	Required Number of Cases	Cost per Serving	Extended Total Cost	COMMENTS	LEAD TIME FROM ORDER (IN WEEKS)
Column 1	Column 2	Column 3	Column 4	Column 5	Column 6	Column 7	Column 8	Column 9	Column 10	Column 11	Column 12	Column 13	Column 14	Column 15	Column 16	Column 17
1856	12,000	SERVINGS	Corn Dog Nugget, Whole Grain – Turkey or Chicken corn dog nugget with the breading being at least 50% whole grain. Reduced fat. Product must meet 2 meat/meat alternates and 2 oz. grain equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program.  Ship Lot: 300 cases	Carnival 11396 House of Raeford 20420 - Turkey House of Raeford 20452-Chicken Tools For Schools 20454 Foster Farms 96086 Leon's 20061	DORI		TOOLS FOR SCHOOLS	20454	10 LB	40.00	\$17.25	300	0.4313	\$5,175.00		2
1856	12,000	SERVINGS	Corn Dog Nugget, Whole Grain – Turkey or Chicken corn dog nugget with the breading being at least 50% whole grain.  Reduced fat. Product must meet 2 meat/meat alternates and 2 oz. grain equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program.  Ship Lot: 300 cases	Carnival 11396 House of Raeford 20420 - Turkey House of Raeford 20452-Chicken Tools For Schools 20454 Foster Farms 96086 Leon's 20061	Monogram	Net 21	Carnival	11396	2/5 LB Bags	40.00	\$17.52	300	0.4380	\$5,256.00	LOCAL BUSINESS	2 weeks
1873	52,500	SERVINGS	Turkey Ham and Cheese Sandwich - IW, Frozen. Turkey Ham and Cheese on WG Roll/Bun. Each sandwich to meet 2 oz meat/meat alternate and 2 oz. grain equivalent for Child Nutrition Program. Pack 100 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 250 cases	Integrated Foods 130008 Anytime Foods 70016 Advanced Pierre 68124	Bake Crafters Food Company	Net 14 Days	Bake Crafters Food Company	6634	84/5oz	84	53.74	625	0.6398	\$33,587.50	or 4 pallet minimu	ı 3 Weeks
1873	52,500	SERVINGS	Turkey Ham and Cheese Sandwich - IW, Frozen. Turkey Ham and Cheese on WG Roll/Bun. Each sandwich to meet 2 oz meat/meat alternate and 2 oz. grain equivalent for Child Nutrition Program. Pack 100 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 250 cases	Integrated Foods 130008 Anytime Foods 70016 Advanced Pierre 68124	Tyson	NET 30 Days	AdvancePierre	68124	45 / 4.4 oz	45	35.27	1,167	0.7838	\$41,148.33		2 weeks
1873	52,500	SERVINGS	Turkey Ham and Cheese Sandwich - IW, Frozen. Turkey Ham and Cheese on WG Roll/Bun. Each sandwich to meet 2 oz meat/meat alternate and 2 oz. grain equivalent for Child Nutrition Program. Pack 100 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 250 cases	Integrated Foods 130008 Anytime Foods 70016 Advanced Pierre 68124	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14 days	Advance	68124	45/4.4oz	45	35.95	1,167	0.7989	\$41,941.67		14 days
1873	52,500	SERVINGS	Turkey Ham and Cheese Sandwich - IW, Frozen. Turkey Ham and Cheese on WG Roll/Bun. Each sandwich to meet 2 oz meat/meat alternate and 2 oz. grain equivalent for Child Nutrition Program. Pack 100 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 250 cases	Integrated Foods 130008 Anytime Foods 70016 Advanced Pierre 68124	Tasty Brands	1%10, Net 11	Tasty Brands	70016	72/4.50 oz	72	\$60.55	729	0.8410	\$44,151.04		14 Calendar Days

Stock Number	Estimated Number of Units (2017)	Unit	Description	Approved Brand (Manufacturer's Product Code)	Bidder	Bidder Terms	Bidder Brand	Bidder Manufacturer's Product Code	Pack Size	Estimated Pounds per Case	Cost per Case	Required Number of Cases	Cost per Pound	Extended Total Cost	COMMENTS	LEAD TIME FROM ORDER (IN WEEKS)
Column 1	Column 2	Column 3	Column 4	Column 5	Column 6	Column 7	Column 8	Column 9	Column 10	Column 11	Column 12	Column 13	Column 14	Column 15	Column 16	Column 17
			Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.	PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT CURRENT AWARDS. ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED.	ITEMS MARKED WITH AN ASTERICK (**) INDICATES AVAILABLE USDA COMMODITIES MIGHT IMPACT USAGE.	ALL SHIP	Items listed are Pre- Approved Brands, SCBE will accept an approved equal (1) as long as it meets the bid specification and (2) tested and approved through SCBE's Sample Submission Process.									

							ry-servings									
Stock Number	Estimated Number of Units (2017)	Unit	Description	Approved Brand (Manufacturer's Product Code)	Bidder	Bidder Terms	Bidder Brand	Bidder Manufacturer's Product Code	Pack Size	Estimated Servings per Case	Cost per Case	Required Number of Cases	Cost per Serving	Extended Total Cost	COMMENTS	LEAD TIME FROM ORDER (IN WEEKS)
Column 1	Column 2	Column 3	Column 4	Column 5	Column 6	Column 7	Column 8	Column 9	Column 10	Column 11	Column 12	Column 13	Column 14	Column 15	Column 16	Column 17
			Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.	PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT CURRENT AWARDS. ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED.	ITEMS MARKED WITH AN ASTERICK (**) INDICATES AVAILABLE USDA COMMODITIES MIGHT IMPACT USAGE.	ALL SHIP LOTS ARE IN CASES.	Items listed are Pre-Approved Brands, SCBE will accept an approved equal (1) as long as it meets the bid specification and (2) tested and approved through SCBE's Sample Submission Process.									
1030	24,000	SERVINGS	Breakfast Cereal Bar, Apple or Cinnamon flavored. 1.25- 1.40z. Cereal bar made from whole grain oats. Whole grain bar that meets one bread.grain serving for the Child Nutrition program. Approximate pack: 160-1.3 oz servings per case. Ship Lot: 150 cases	Fieldstone 09797 National Food Group, Inc. 60460/BR1330 General Mills 16000-19437-0 Kellogg's 48396	National Food Group	Net 30 Days	Zee Zees / NFG	860460	160/1.3 oz.	160	\$28.64	150	0.1790	\$4,296.00		3
1030	24,000	SERVINGS	Breakfast Cereal Bar, Apple or Cinnamon flavored. 1.25- 1.40c. Cereal bar made from whole grain oats. Whole grain bar that meets one bread.grain serving for the Child Nutrition program. Approximate pack: 160-1.3 oz servings per case. Ship Lot: 150 cases	Fieldstone 09797 National Food Group, Inc. 60460/BR1330 General Mills 16000-19437-0 Kellogg's 48396	DARLINGTON	net 30	Appleways	70100	1/216 ct	216	\$43.25	111	0.2002	\$4,805.56		2 weeks
1030	24,000	SERVINGS	Breakfast Cereal Bar, Apple or Cinnamon flavored. 1.25- 1.40z. Cereal bar made from whole grain oats. Whole grain bar that meets one bread.grain serving for the Child Nutrition program. Approximate pack: 160-1.3 oz servings per case. Ship Lot: 150 cases	Fieldstone 09797 National Food Group, Inc. 60460/BR1330 General Mills 16000-19437-0 Kellogg's 48396	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14days	GM	31911	96/1.42oz	96	\$24.75	250	0.2578	\$6,187.50	31911-appcin	10 days
1030	24,000	SERVINGS	Breakfast Cereal Bar, Apple or Cinnamon flavored. 1.25- 1.40z. Cereal bar made from whole grain oats. Whole grain bar that meets one bread.grain serving for the Child Nutrition program. Approximate pack: 160-1.3 oz servings per case. Ship Lot: 150 cases	Fieldstone 09797 National Food Group, Inc. 60460/BR1330 General Mills 16000-19437-0 Kellogg's 48396	Bake Crafters Food Company	Net 14 Days	Bake Crafters Food Company	1289	150/1.5oz	150	\$40.11	160	0.2674	\$6,417.60	or 4 pallet minim	2 Weeks
1105	30,000	SERVINGS	Vanilla Grahams, Character shaped, Whole Grain - Made with whole wheat flour. Individually wrapped. Must meet 1 bread requirement. 300ct/2pk/.9oz per case. Ship Lot: 100 cases	Readi Bake 56073 MJM Marketing 404001 Campbell's 19246	National Food Group	Net 30 Days	Zee Zees / NFG	610688, 610687, 609144	200/1 oz.	200	\$34.00	150	0.1700	\$5,100.00		3
1142	24,000	SERVINGS	Breakfast Cereal Bar, Strawberry flavored. 1.25-1.4oz. Cereal bar made from whole grain oats. Whole grain bar that meets one bread grain serving for the Child Nutrition program. Approximate pack: 160-1.3 oz servings per case. Ship Lot: 150 cases	TFS/Good Source 54507710 General Mills 319314 Appleway 70400 Kellogg's Nutri Grain 59772	National Food Group	Net 30 Days	Zee Zees / NFG	860475	160/1.3 oz.	160	28.64	150	0.1790	\$4,296.00	order with SC	3
1142	24,000	SERVINGS	Breakfast Cereal Bar, Strawberry flavored. 1.25-1.4oz. Cereal bar made from whole grain oats. Whole grain bar that meets one bread grain serving for the Child Nutrition program. Approximate pack: 160-1.3 oz servings per case. Ship Lot: 150 cases	TFS/Good Source 54507710 General Mills 319314 Appleway 70400 Kellogg's Nutri Grain 59772	DARLINGTON	net 30	APPLEWAYS	70400	1/216 CT	216	43.25	111	0.2002	\$4,805.56		2 weeks
1142	24,000	SERVINGS	Breakfast Cereal Bar, Strawberry flavored. 1.25-1.4oz. Cereal bar made from whole grain oats. Whole grain bar that meets one bread grain serving for the Child Mutrition program. Approximate pack: 160-1.3 oz servings per case. Ship Lot: 150 cases	TFS/Good Source 54507710 General Mills 319314 Appleway 70400 Kellogg's Nutri Grain 59772	Sysco Memphis,LLC	Net 14days	Kelloggs	59772	96/1.55oz	96	23.49	250	0.2447	\$5,872.50		10 days

Stock Number	Estimated Number of Units (2017)	Unit	Description	Approved Brand (Manufacturer's Product Code)	Bidder	Bidder Terms	Bidder Brand	Bidder Manufacturer's Product Code	Pack Size	Estimated Servings per Case	Cost per Case	Required Number of Cases	Cost per Serving	Extended Total Cost	COMMENTS	LEAD TIME FROM ORDER (IN WEEKS)
Column 1	Column 2	Column 3	Column 4	Column 5	Column 6	Column 7	Column 8	Column 9	Column 10	Column 11	Column 12	Column 13	Column 14	Column 15	Column 16	Column 17
1142	24,000	SERVINGS	Breakfast Cereal Bar, Strawberry flavored. 1.25-1.4oz. Cereal bar made from whole grain oats. Whole grain bar that meets one bread.grain serving for the Child Nutrition program. Approximate pack: 160-1.3 oz servings per case. Ship Lot: 150 cases	TFS/Good Source 54507710 General Mills 319314 Appleway 70400 Kellogg's Nutri Grain 59772	Bake Crafters Food Company	Net 14 Days	Bake Crafters Food Company	1288	150/1.5oz	150	38.23	160	0.2549	\$6,116.80	or 4 pallet minim	2 Weeks
1196	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Fruit Punch, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximately 40 servings /case. Ship Lote: 600 cases	Apples & Eve 0-76301-86001-8 Juicy Juice 00059 Juicy Bowl 90039 Ardmore Farms 62008	Harvest Hill Beverage Company	Net 30 Days	Juicy Juice	89497 00059	4.23	40	5.95	1,275	0.1488	\$7,586.25		10 days
1196	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Fruit Punch, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximately 40 servings /case. Ship Lote: 600 cases	Apples & Eve 0-76301-86001-8 Juicy Juice 00059 Juicy Bowl 90039 Ardmore Farms 62008	Apple & Eve	30 Days	Apple & Eve 100% Fruit Punch	86001	40	40	\$6.00	1,275	0.1500	\$7,650.00		2 weeks
1196	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Fruit Punch, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximately 40 servings /case. Ship Lote: 600 cases	Apples & Eve 0-76301-86001-8 Juicy Juice 00059 Juicy Bowl 90039 Ardmore Farms 62008	Country Pure Foods	Net 30 Days	Ardmore Farms	62008	44/4.23 OZ.	44	7.74	1,159	0.1759	\$8,971.36		2
1196	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Fruit Punch, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximately 40 servings /case. Ship Lote: 600 cases	Apples & Eve 0-76301-86001-8 Juicy Juice 00059 Juicy Bowl 90039 Ardmore Farms 62008	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14days	Ardmore	62008	44/4.23oz	44	8.61	1,159	0.1957	\$9,979.77		14 days
1320	26,000	SERVINGS	Cereal Snack Mix, Individual pkgmade from whole grain flour and whole corn. Package size to be a minimum of 8.75 oz. Total fat must not exceed 3.5% of calories, Saturated Fat must not exceed 1.0% of total calories., 3.5% or less sugar (by weight) No more than 230 mg. Sodium. Must provide 1 oz. grain equivalent for the Child Nutrition Program.  Approximate Pack: 104/case.  Ship Lot: 250 cases	Quaker Smart Mix 36308-2	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14days	Quaker	36308	104/.875oz	104	\$28.20	250	0.2712	\$7,050.00		10 days
1321	27,000	SERVINGS	Tortilla Chip, Corn, Reduced Fat, Nacho Cheese Flavored, 1 oz. Bag, Total fat must not exceed 35% of calories, saturated fat must not exceed 10% of total calories. No more than 230 mg. Sodium. Product must meet the Smart Snack Guidelines. Must provide at least 1 oz.grain eq. for the Child Nutrition program. Shelf Life: 30 days from delivery date.  Approximate Pack: 72-1.0 oz. bags per case.  Ship Lot: 150 cases	Pepsico/Frito Lay 31748 Barrel of Fun 18607	Sysco Memphis,LLC	Net 14days	Frito Lay	31748	72/1oz	72	\$16.50	375	0.2292	\$6,187.50		10 days

Dry-Servings Page 9

Stock Number	Estimated Number of Units (2017)	Unit	Description	Approved Brand (Manufacturer's Product Code)	Bidder	Bidder Terms	Bidder Brand	Bidder Manufacturer's Product Code	Pack Size	Estimated Servings per Case	Cost per Case	Required Number of Cases	Cost per Serving	Extended Total Cost	COMMENTS	LEAD TIME FROM ORDER (IN WEEKS)
Column 1	Column 2	Column 3	Column 4	Column 5	Column 6	Column 7	Column 8	Column 9	Column 10	Column 11	Column 12	Column 13	Column 14	Column 15	Column 16	Column 17
1323	25,000	SERVINGS	Tortilla Chip, Corn, Reduced Fat, Cool Ranch Flavored. Made from whole corn 1 oz individua bags. Total fat must not exceed 35% of calories, Saturated Fat must not exceed 10% of total calories and no more than 230 mg. of Sodium. Must meet the Smart Snack guidelines. Must provide at least 1 oz eq of grain per the Child Nutrition Program guidelines. ON label or crediting statement required. Minimum shelf life: 30 days from delivery date. Approximate Pack: 72/case. Ship Lot: 150 cases	No Approved Brands	Sysco Memphis,LLC	Net 14days	Frito Lay	36096	72/1oz	72	\$16.50	347	0.2292	\$5,729.17		10 days
1544	25,000	SERVINGS	Cereal Snack Mix, Strawberry Individual pkgmade from whole grain flour and whole corn. Package size to be a minimum of 1.03 oz. Total fat must not exceed 35% of calories, Saturated Fat must not exceed 10% of total calories, 35% or less sugar (by weight) No more than 230 mg. Sodium. Must provide 1 oz. grain equivalent for the Child Nutrition Program.  Approximate Pack: 60/case.  Ship Lot: 200 cases	General Mills 31937	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14days	GM	31937	60/1.03oz	60	\$19.11	417	0.3185	\$7,962.50		10 days
1565	26,250	SERVINGS	Snack Crackers, Spicy Cheddar, WG – Baked spicy cheddar snack crackers. Individual single serve packs equal to a minimum of 0.75 oz by weight and provide a minimum of 1 oz eq of grain per the Child Nutrition Program guidelines. Must be made with real cheddar cheese. CN label or crediting statement required. Approximate Pack: 175/case. Ship Lot: 150 cases	No Approved Brands	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14days	Kelloggs	10238	175/.75oz	175	\$26.88	150	0.1536	\$4,032.00		10 days
1565	26,250	SERVINGS	Snack Crackers, Spicy Cheddar, WG – Baked spicy cheddar snack crackers. Individual single serve packs equal to a minimum of 0.75 oz by weight and provide a minimum of 1 oz eq of grain per the Child Nutrition Program guidelines. Must be made with real cheddar cheese. CN label or crediting statement required. Approximate Pack: 175/case. Ship Lot: 150 cases	No Approved Brands	Darlington	net 30	CRAVE-N-RAVE	51110	1/300 CT	300	\$48.52	88	0.1617	\$4,245.50		2 weeks
1588	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Orange, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximate Pack: 40 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 600 cases	Apple & Eve 0-76301-86003-2 Juice Bowl 90038 Ardmore Farms 62000 Juicy Juice #00058	Harvest Hill Beverage Company	Net 30 Days	Juicy Juice	89497 00058	4.23oz	40	\$5.95	1,275	0.1488	\$7,586.25		10 days
1588	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Orange, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximate Pack: 40 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 600 cases	Apple & Eve 0-76301-86003-2 Juice Bowl 90038 Ardmore Farms 62000 Juicy Juice #00058	Apple & Eve	30 Days	Apple & Eve 100% Orange Tangerine	86003	40	40	\$6.00	1,275	0.1500	\$7,650.00		2 weeks
1588	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Orange, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximate Pack: 40 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 600 cases	Apple & Eve 0-76301-86003-2 Juice Bowl 90038 Ardmore Farms 62000 Juicy Juice #00058	Country Pure Foods	Net 30 Days	Ardmore Farms	62000	44/4.23 OZ.	44	\$8.69	1,159	0.1975	\$10,072.50		2
1588	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Orange, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximate Pack: 40 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 600 cases	Apple & Eve 0-76301-86003-2 Juice Bowl 90038 Ardmore Farms 62000 Juicy Juice #00058	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14days	Ardmore	62000	44/4.23oz	44	\$9.67	1,159	0.2198	\$11,208.41		10 days

Stock Number	Estimated Number of Units (2017)	Unit	Description	Approved Brand (Manufacturer's Product Code)	Bidder	Bidder Terms	Bidder Brand	Bidder Manufacturer's Product Code	Pack Size	Estimated Servings per Case	Cost per Case	Required Number of Cases	Cost per Serving	Extended Total Cost	COMMENTS	LEAD TIME FROM ORDER (IN WEEKS)
Column 1	Column 2	Column 3	Column 4	Column 5	Column 6	Column 7	Column 8	Column 9	Column 10	Column 11	Column 12	Column 13	Column 14	Column 15	Column 16	Column 17
1589	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Apple, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximate Pack: 40 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 600 cases	Apple & Eve 0-76301-86000-1 Ardmore Farms 62001 Juice Bowl 90040 Juicy Juice #00055	Harvest Hill Beverage Company	Net 30 Days	Juicy Juice	89497 00055	4.23oz	40	\$5.95	1,275	0.1488	\$7,586.25		10 days
1589	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Apple, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximate Pack: 40 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 600 cases	Apple & Eve 0-76301-86000-1 Ardmore Farms 62001 Juice Bowl 90040 Juicy Juice #00055	Apple & Eve	30 Days	Apple & Eve 100% Apple Juice	86000	40	40	\$6.00	1,275	0.1500	\$7,650.00		2 weeks
1589	51,000	SERVINGS		Apple & Eve 0-76301-86000-1 Ardmore Farms 62001 Juice Bowl 90040 Juicy Juice #00055	Country Pure Foods	Net 30 Days	Ardmore Farms	62001	44/4.23 OZ.	44	\$7.74	1,159	0.1759	\$8,971.36		2
1589	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Apple, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximate Pack: 40 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 600 cases	Apple & Eve 0-76301-86000-1 Ardmore Farms 62001 Juice Bowl 90040 Juicy Juice #00055	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14days	Ardmore	62001	44/4.23oz	44	\$8.61	1,159	0.1957	\$9,979.77		10 days
1591	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Grape, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximate Pack: 40 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 600 cases	Apple & Eve 0-76301-86004-9 Ardmore Farms 62002 Juice Bowl 90042 Juice W00057	Harvest Hill Beverage Company	Net 30 Days	Juicy Juice	89497 00057	4.23oz	40	\$5.95	1,275	0.1488	\$7,586.25		10 days
1591	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Grape, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximate Pack: 40 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 600 cases	Apple & Eve 0-76301-86004-9 Ardmore Farms 62002 Juice Bowl 90042 Juice W00057 Juice #00057	Apple & Eve	30 Days	Apple & Eve 100% White Grape	86004	40	40	\$6.00	1,275	0.1500	\$7,650.00		2 weeks
1591	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Grape, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximate Pack: 40 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 600 cases	Apple & Eve 0-76301-86004-9 Ardmore Farms 62002 Juice Bowl 90042 Juicy Juice #00057	Country Pure Foods	Net 30 Days	Ardmore Farms	62002	44/4.23 OZ.	44	\$7.74	1,159	0.1759	\$8,971.36		2
1591	51,000	SERVINGS	Juice, Grape, 4.23 oz. 100% pure juice. Made from juice concentrate. Shelf stable with wrapped straw attached. Approximate Pack: 40 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 600 cases	Apple & Eve 0-76301-86004-9 Ardmore Farms 62002 Juice Bowl 90042 Juicy Juice #00057	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14days	Ardmore	62002	44/4.23oz	44	\$8.61	1,159	0.1957	\$9,979.77		10 days
1716	107,000	SERVINGS	Raisin- Flavored, Fruit. Watermelon. Watermelon flavored raisins made from golden raisins. Must meet at least 1/4 c fruit for the Child Nutrition Program. Approximate Pack: 144/1.5oz packs per case.  Ship Lot: 350 cases	Raisels 00537-8	National Food Group	Net 30 Days	Zee Zees / NFG	609271	144/1.3 oz.	144	\$36.00	743	0.2500	\$26,750.00		
1716	107,000	SERVINGS	Raisin- Flavored, Fruit. Watermelon. Watermelon flavored raisins made from golden raisins. Must meet at least 1/4 c fruit for the Child Nutrition Program. Approximate Pack: 144/1.5oz packs per case.  Ship Lot: 350 cases	Raisels 00537-8	Sysco Memphis,LLC	Net 14days	Champion	00527-9(watermelon)	200/1.5oz	200	\$56.23	535	0.2812	\$30,083.05		14 days

Sto Num	ck Nu ber	stimated umber of Units (2017)	Unit	Description	Approved Brand (Manufacturer's Product Code)	Bidder	Bidder Terms	Bidder Brand	Bidder Manufacturer's Product Code	Pack Size	Estimated Servings per Case	Cost per Case	Required Number of Cases	Cost per Serving	Extended Total Cost	COMMENTS	LEAD TIME FROM ORDER (IN WEEKS)
Colur	nn 1 C	Column 2	Column 3	Column 4	Column 5	Column 6	Column 7	Column 8	Column 9	Column 10	Column 11	Column 12	Column 13	Column 14	Column 15	Column 16	Column 17
1720		24,000 S		Tortilla Chip, Corn, Round, Plain, Reduced Fat, Whole Grain. Bite sized chips made with whole corn. Please indicate package size and case count if packed differently. Must meet the Smart Snacks guidelines. Total fat must not exceed 35% of calories, saturated fat must not exceed 35% of total calories. No more than 230 mg. Sodium. Must provide at least 2 oz. grain equivalents for Child Nutrition program. CN label or crediting statement required. Minimum Shelf Life: 30 days from delivery date. Approximate Pack: 64/1.45 oz. servings case.  Ship Lot: 150 cases		Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14days	Frito Lay	30103	64/1.45oz	64	\$20.55	375	0.3211	\$7,706.25		10 days

Dry-Servings Page 12

Stock Number	Estimated Number of Units (2017)	Unit	Description	Approved Brand (Manufacturer's Product Code)	Bidder	Bidder Terms	Bidder Brand	Bidder Manufacturer's Product Code	Pack Size	Estimated Servings per Case	Cost per Case	Required Number of Cases	Cost per Serving	Extended Total Cost	COMMENTS	LEAD TIME FROM ORDER (IN WEEKS)
Column 1	Column 2	Column 3	Column 4	Column 5	Column 6	Column 7	Column 8	Column 9	Column 10	Column 11	Column 12	Column 13	Column 14	Column 15	Column 16	Column 17
			Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.	I AWARDS ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE	ITEMS MARKED WITH AN ASTERICK (**) INDICATES AVAILABLE USDA COMMODITIES MIGHT IMPACT USAGE.	ALL SHIP LOTS ARE IN CASES.	Items listed are Pre-Approved Brands, SCBE will accept an approved equal (1) as long as it meets the bid specification and (2) tested and approved through SCBE's Sample Submission Process.									
1060	25,000	SERVINGS	Reduced fat Cheddar Cheese Cubes — 1 oz Individual single serve packs. Each pack must provide a minimum of 1 oz meat/meat alternate eq per the Child Nutrition Program guidelines. Must meet the Smart Snack guidelines. Must be made with 100% real cheddar cheese, no TVP or ISP. CN label or crediting statement required. Approximate Pack: 200 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 125 cases		Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14days	Land o Lakes	44113	200/1oz	200	\$54.05	125	0.2703	\$6,756.25		10days
1870	61,000	SERVINGS	Potato Salad, Bulk - Potato salad with mayonnaise, mustard, onions sweet pickle relish, celery, pimentos and spices. Potatoes should be cubed no larger than 1/2". Packed 2/12 lb resealable tubs. Serving size equals 1/2 cup. Approximate Pack: 90 servings per case.  Ship Lot: 300 cases	St. Clair Steakhouse 101006	Sysco Memphis, LLC	Net 14days	St Clair	101006	2/12#	265	\$28.47	230	0.1074	\$6,553.47		10 days